From: Lorraine Cordell [lorraine32@blueyonder.co.uk]
Sent: 29 October 2014 16:35
To: 'Martin Jenkin'

Subject: RE: Simon Cordell
Hi Martin

The money is in the bank all ready

Lorraine

From: Martin Jenkin [mailto: martinjenkin@broadsuredirect.com]
Sent: 28 October 2014 17:56

To: 'Lorraine Cordell'

Subject: RE: Simon Cordell

Lorraine,

The payment is already in cycle so please ensure the money is there to be taken as cleared funds by the 30t Jatest

Regards

Martin Jenkin
DDI 01843 598744
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From: Lorraine Cordell [mailto:lorraine32@blueyonder.co.uk]
Sent: 22 October 2014 13:15

To: 'Martin Jenkin'

Subject: RE: Simon Cordell

Hi Martin
Thank you for the reply yes can | make the payment of £328.45 today please.
Regards

Lorraine

From: Martin Jenkin [mailto: martinjenkin@broadsuredirect.com]
Sent: 22 October 2014 12:10

To: 'Lorraine Cordell'
Subject: RE: Simon Cordell

Hi Lorraine,




